INVITATION FOR BID

{SSUING OFFICE:
& PORT AUTHAORITY OF GUAM
12;’“" ‘A = Government of Guam
RORY ). RESPICIO 1026 Cabras Highway, Ste 201,
General Manager Piti, Guam 96915
DATE ISSUED: March 7, 2024 INVITATION FOR 81D No.: IFB/PAG-007-24
BID FOR: PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM TIRES AND BATTERIES BID
SPECIFICATIONS: SEE ATTACHED
DESTINATION: PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM

REQIUIRED DELWERY DATE, 45 Days Upon Receipt of Purchase Order. Delivery schedule time and quantity will be coordinated
between the successful bidder and the requesting department on an as-needed basis. For a period of One {1} year on an as-
needed basis upon the availability of funds with an option to extend for 90 days. THIS 15 AN INDEFINITE QUANTITY BID.

INSTRUCTION TO 8IDDERS:
INDICATE WHETHER: INDIVIDUAL PARTNERSHIP CORPORATION \/ LLC "P"

INCORPORATED 1 GuamU.S.A,

THIS BID SHALL BE SUBMITTED in duplicate with one (1} electronic copy and sealed to the issuing office above
before or until Tuesday, M; 2 : .m_, Chamorra Standard Time {Guam Time] and shall be
publicly opened. Any Bid submitted after the time and date specified above shall be rejected. See attached
General Terms and Conditions, and Sealed Bid Solicitation for details.

The undersigned offers and agrees to furnish within the time specified, the articles and services at the price
stated opposite the respective items listed on the schedule provided unless otherwise specified by the bidder
In consideration of the expense of the Government in the opening, tabulating, and evaluating this and other bids,
and other considerations, the undersigned agrees that this bid remains firm and irrevocable within 80 calendar
days from the date of opening to supply any or all the items which prices are quoted.

NAME AND AODRESS OF BIDDER: SIGNATURE AND TITLE OF PERSON
AUTHORIZED T SIGN THIS BID:
BMI Automotive, LLC.
dba: NAPA Auto Parts
1790 Army Drive, Suite 101 Travis Benavente, Battery Specialist

Dededo, Guam 96929

AWARD: CONTRACT NO.. _IFBIPAG-007-24 _ amount. $ 21,474.46 oare: 04/30/2024

mem no(s). awanoeo: _17.1 - 24.1

NAME AND ADDRESS OF CONTRACTOR: CONTRACTING DFFICER:

BMI Automotive, LLC, dba: NAPA Auto Parts

1790 Army Drive, Suite 101 Dededo, Guam 96929 P él /l,(.(é‘
rorY). RESPICIO

SIGNATURE AND TITLE OF PERSON General Manager

AUTHORIZED TO SIGN THIS CONTRACT:
Name: AASNUS 65"{**5’4//6

ff7 =T
Title: {5/}5 MS:};/ Date: 5/7' / W‘/
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NAYA MUV VRED

Rem

1.1

2.1

i1

4.1

IFB-PAG-007-24 Port Authority of Guam Tires and Batteries Bid

Unit Price
ion Qry. yom Price Extenslon
18.5 X 8.50-8 TIRE 8 A § s_NOBID
SPECIFICATIONS: BIDDING ON/REMARKS:
GOLF CARY

& PLY Rating (REF: NANCO NE99) or equal
Match OEM Tires: Low profite for clearance on
Golf Carts, Summer Type Tires, Bias Construction

Bidding on:
Manufacturer:
Model:

Year:
Piace of Origin:
Date of Delivery:

205/70 R16 TIRE 4 EA

SPECIFICATIONS:
2009 SUV-JEEP PATRIOT
CHEVROLET COLORADO

Bidding on:
Manufacturer:
Mode!:
Year:
Place of Origin:
Date of Delivery:

215/55 Ri6 TIRE 8 EA

SPECIFICATIONS:
FORD TRANSIT CARGO VAN (2),
MAZDA 3-4DOOR SEDAN

Bidding on:
Manufacturer:
Model:
Year:
Place of Qrigin:
Date of Delivery:

225/70 R15 TUBELESS TIRE 10 EA

SPECIFICATIONS:

FORD RANGER/FORD UTILITY PICK-UP
TOYOTA TACOMA / DODGE DAKOTA
Highway All Season, Black Sidewalls, Load
Index 100, Speed Rating S

Bidding on:
Maodel:
Manufacturer:
Year:
Place of Origin:
Date of Delivery:
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s ¢ NOBID
RKS:

3 s NO BID
BIDDING DN/REMARKS:

$ ¢ NOBID

BIDDING ON/REMARKS:




Item

5.1

6.1

7.1

81

(! qary. YoM

Unit
Price

Price

Extension

245/55R18 TUBELESS 4 EA
TIRE, ALL-SEASON

SPECIFICATIONS:
FORD EXPLORER WAGON

Bidding on:
Manufacturer:
Model:
Year:
Place of Qrigin:
Date of Delivery:

LT245/75 R16 TUBELESS & EA
TIRE

SPECIFICATIONS:

FORD VAN/ CHEVY PICKUP
TOYOTA TACOMA/PRE-RUNNER
FORD 250 PiTK-UP TRUCK

Bidding on:
Manufacturer:
Model:

Year:

Place of Origin:
Date of Delivery:

245/7SR17 TIRE, 6 EA
ALL-TERRAIN

SPECIFICATIONS:
FORD 650 DUALLY / DODGE 2500 TRUCK
FORD F350 / FORD F150

Bidding on:
Manufacturer:
Model:
Year:
Place of Origin:
Date of Delivery:

700x12-12 PLY TUBE TYPE 8 EA
TIRE, NON-DIRECTIONAL

SPECIFICATIONS:
2008 HYSTER FORKLIFT 5 TON {REAR}

Bidding on:
Manufacturer:
Model:

Year:

Ptace of Origin:
Date of Delivery:
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5. NOBID

BIDDING ON/REMARKS:

s NOBID

BIDDING ON/REMARKS:

¢ NOBID

BIDDING ON/REMARKS:

¢ NOBID

BIDDIN

KS




item

9.1

10.1

" 111

121

ription Qary.

Yom

Unit Price
Price Extension

7.50 X 15 - 12 PLY TUBE TYPE 8
TIRE, NON-DIRECTIONAL

SPECIFICATIONS:
2008 HYSTER FORKLIFT 5 TON (FRONT)

Bidding on:
Manufacturer:
Model:

Year:

Place of Origin:
Date of Delivery:

750X 16 - 12 PLY TUBE TYPE 8
TIRE, NON-DIRECTIONAL

SPECIFICATIONS:
2016 DOOSAN FORKLIFT 5 TON (FRONT)

Bidding on:

Manufacturer:
Model:
Year:
Place of Origin:
Date of Delivery:

11.00 X 22.5R - 16 PLY TIRE 20

SPECIFICATIONS:

2010/2016 OTTAWA YARD TRACTORS
Pneumnatic, 16-Ply, Load Rating G,

All Positions {Steer/Drive),

Drive Position Commercial Radial

Bidding on:
Manufacturer;
Model:

Year:

Place of Origin:
Date of Delivery:

18.00R25- 40-PLY TIRE 8

SPECIFICATIONS:
TOP LIFTERS
Pneumatic, 40-PLY Rating, For All Position

TRIANGLE TSMS L5(Steer/Drive), Non Directional;

Tubetess (REF: IND-4) or egua!

Bidding on:
Manufacturer:
Maodel:

Year:
Place of Origin:
Date of Delivery:
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¢ s NOBID

BIDDING ON/REMARKS:

s s NOBID

BIDDING ON/REMARKS:

s___ ¢ NOBID
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s s NOBID
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13.1 VALVE STEMS

RUSBER $ $ NG BID
INDUSTRIAL $ $
LT/PASSENGER VEHICLES $ $
INDUSTRIAL VEHICLES s $
14.1 MOUNTING/DEMOUNTING, BALANCING 3 $ NO BID
& ALIGNMENT
LT/PASSENGER VEHICLES s $
INDUSTRIAL VEHICLES s $
15.1 DISPOSAL FEE
NO BID
LT/PASSENGER VEHICLES $ $
INDUSTRIAL VEHICLES ] $

156.1 WARRANTY: MANUFACTURE RECOMMENDED WARRANTY:
Under normal utilization, any defects in workmanship within 90 days of installation, Bidder will
replace defective tire with the same size tire at no cost (including disposal of defective tire) i.e.
uneven wear, bulging on tread or side wall.

NO BID

{ ] Yes, ofier as requested.

{ 1 No, offer the following;

17.1 D317 YELLOW TOP OPTIMA 12 eA $448.81 $5,385.72
SPECIFICATIONS: .
KALMAR OTTAWA T-2 TRACTORS Offer: Oplima Battery a1 TYEL
Weight: 59.818 '
Height: 9.38 IN Comply with all specs
Length: 12.81 N
Width: 6.56 IN
€20 Capacity: 75AH
Starting Power: 900 CCA
Reserve Capacity @ 25 AMPS: 155 Minutes
Terminal Type: Threaded Post - Type T12 V

18.1 D27F YELLOW TOP OPTIMA 10 ea $369.49 $3,694.90

SPECIFICATIONS: Offer: Optima Battery
FORK LIFTS 20/10 TON; ' NAPA Part # N99D27FYEL
JOHN DEERE BACKHOE; DUMP TRUCK

Weight: 53.21LB Exceplion to specs: Weight 56.5 LB
Height: 8.61 IN

Length: 12.81 IN

Width: 6.56 IN

C20 Capacity: 66 AH

Starting Power: 830 CCA

Reserve Capacity @ 2% AMPS: 140 Minutes

Terminal Type: SAE—Type A
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Item Unit Price

No.  Description Qry. uom Price Extension

19.1 D21M BLUE TOP OPTIMA a €A $439.12 51,756.48
SPECIFICATIONS: .

Offer: Optima Battery -

WATERCRAFT/GOATS NAPA Part #: N99D31MBLUE
Weight:59.8 LB
Height: 9.38 IN Comply with all specs
Length: 12.81IN
Width: 6.56 IN

C20 Capacity: 75 AH

Starting Power: 900 CCA

Reserve Capacity @ 25 AMPS: 155 Minutes
Terminal Type: Type M

201 35 RED TOP OPTIMA 10 €A $291.10 $2.911.00
SPECIFICATIONS: Offer: Optima Battery -
ACCENT/TOYOTA/FORD/CHEVY NAPA Part #: N9935RED
MAZDA/KIA PASSENGER VEHICLES
Weight: 31.7 L8 Comply with ali specs
Height: 7.69 IN
Length: 9.38 IN
Width: 6.75 IN
€20 Capacity: 44 AH
Starting Power: 720 CCA
Reserve Capacity @ 25 AMPS: 90 Minutes
Terminal Type: SAE - Type A

211 34/78 RED TOP OPTIMA 16 ea $309.51 $4,952.16

SPECIFICATIONS: .
Offer. Opti -

FORD/CHEVY TRUCKS NRPrRan?’t“#e:ryNQQSWBRED
Weight: 38.8 18
Height: 7.88 IN Exception to specs: Weight: 41 LB.
Length: 10.06 IN
width: 6.94 IN

C20 Capacity: 50 AH
Starting Power: 800 CCA
Reserve Capacity @ 25 AMPS: 100 Minules

Terminal Type: A/S (Duel}

22.1 GROUP 8D BATTERY 12V 4 Ea $281.62 $1,126.48
Minimum 1200 CCA Ofter: NAPA Battery Part #; 7271FT
Terminal Type: Auto Post (SAE) Minimum CCA1425

23.1 GROUP 4D BATTERY 12V a EA $236.60 £ 946.40
Minirmurm 950 CCA Offer: NAPA Battery Part # 7266
Terminal Type: Auto Post (SAE) Minimum CCA 1050

24.1 8V BATTERY 4 EA §175.33 $701.32
for: Electrical Golf Cart

Offer. NAPA Battery Part#: 8148
AMP Hour: 165 AH Comply with all specs

Battery Terminal Type: STUD; Battery Type: Deep Cycle
Helght: 11,125 in; Length: 10.25 in; Voltage: 8V
Weight: 68 Ibs; Wet or Dry: Wet; Width; 7.125 in.

NOTES; NO BID
e Tires to fit E.T.R.T.0. and T.R.A. Rims for item Nos. 8.1; 9.1;10.1; 11.1;12.1; 13.1

» Tires must have DOT Tire Identification number for Item Nos. 2.1; 3.1;4.1;5.1: 6.1; 7.1 NO BID
+» Batteries are all Gel Type, 12V, maintenance-free for item nos. 18.1; 19.1; 20.1; 21.1; 22.1; COMPLY
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* Batteries are all led-acid type, we-charged, 12VDC/8V, Maintenance-free for itern nos. 23.1;
24.1 COMPLY

7 DEFINITIONS:

=  ET.R.T.0: European Tyre and Technical Organization
* T.R.A: Tire and Rim Assoclation

» OEM: Original Equipment Manufacturer
SUV: Sport Utilities Vehicle

= LT: Light Truck

ST: Special Trailer

CCA: Cold Cranking Amps

SAE: Society of Automotive Engineers
AMP: Ampere

= V:Voits

= Ah: Amp-Hours

These specifications were developed by the staff of the Fleet Maintenance Division of the Port Authority
of Guam Evelyn G. Pangelinan, Maintenance Planner-Equipment, Geraldo E. Tajalle, Supply Technician
I, John Leon Guerrero, Fleet Supervisor, Shine A. San Agustin, Equipment Superintendent [Acting], Glenn
B. Nelson, Maintenance Manager {Acting), Reviewed by Annie LG. Sablan, Procurement/Supply
Manager [Acting), and approved by Rory ). Respicio, General Manager.

$21,474.46

COMPLY
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