INVITATION FOR BID

ISSUING OFFICE:

THE PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM
QZ K S GOVERNMENT OF GUAM
AL 1026 CABRAS HIGHWAY, SUITE 201,
RORY'l. RESPICIO PITI, GUAM 96925
GENERAL MANAGER
paTE IssueD: JULY [0, 2020 BID INVITATION NO: IFB/PAG-009-20

BID FOR: VARIOUS LUBRICANTS AND DEGREASERS FOR PORT’S EQUIPMENTS AND GANTRIES
SPECIFICATION: SEE BELOW
DESTINATION: PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM

REQUIRED DELIVERY DATE: 30 days from receipt of purchase order for a period of one (1) year upon the availability
of funds. This is an indefinite quantity bid.

INSTRUCTION TO BIDDERS:
INDICATE WHETHER: INDIVIDUAL PARTNERSHIP CORPORATION  "P"LLC

INCORPORATED IN: ___Guam U.S.A.

This bid shall be submitted in duplicate and sealed to the issuing office above no later than {Time) 10:00 AM Date:
Tuesday, July 28, 2020 and shall be publicly opened. Bid submitted after the time and date specified above shall
be rejected. See attached General Terms and Conditions, and Sealed Bid Solicitation for details.

The undersigned offers and agrees to furnish within the time specified, the articles and services at the price stated
opposite the respective items listed on the schedule provided, unless otherwise specified by the bidder. In
consideration to the expense of the Government in opening, tabulating, and evaluating this and other bids, and
other considerations, the undersigned agrees that this bid remain firm and irrevocable within 90 calendar days
from the date opening to supply any or all the items which prices are quoted.

NAME AND ADDRESS OF BIDDER: SIGNATURE AND TITLE OF PERSON

BMI Automotive, LLC. dba: NAPA Auto Parts

1790 Army Drive, Suite 101

Ricl eeks, gube @cialist

Dededo, Guam 96929

AWARD: CONTRACTNO.:IFB/PAG-009520 AmounT: $33,474 .59 DATE: 9/24/2020

ITEM NO(S). Awarpep:1=4, 6-13, 16 and 17.
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ITEM UNIT PRICE

No. DESCRIPTION QTY  UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

1. OiL, HYDRAULIC 5 DR $_470.00 $_2,350.00
ISO VG#32, SAE10, ANTIWEAR

Bidding On:

Brand: Valvoline

Part/Model Number: __ #692250

Specifications: COMPLY

For Equipment: 5 Ton Forklifts {Hydraulics)
Sullair Air Compressor {Compressor Unit)
Gantry Cranes

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

2. OIL, HYDRAULIC 4 DR $.1,120.97 ¢ 4,483.88
J20C {JOHN DEERE), ANTI WEAR

Bidding On:
Brand: Valvoline
Part/Model Number: _ #3810
Specifications: COMPLY
For Equipment: Top lifters (Hydraulics)
10 Ton & 20 ton Forklifts (Hydraulics)

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

3.  OIL ENGINE 8 DR $63400 5523260 % ﬁﬁ'l 2.0
SAE 15W40, API CATEGORY CH-4, ,
API CERTIFIED FOR DIESEL ENGINES

Bidding On:

Brand: NAPA
Part/Model Number: _#75-128
Specifications: COMPLY

For Equipment: Top lifters, Forklift, Yard Tractors
(Support Equipment) Air compressor / 375
Light Tower / Plant, Gantry Cranes

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

4. OlL, ENGINE 4 DR $ 64108 ¢ 2,564.32 -~

SAE 5W20, API CATEGORY SM,
API CERTIFIED FOR GASOLINE ENGINES

Bidding On:

Brand: NAPA
Part/Model Number: __ #75-154
Specifications: COMPLY

For Equipment: All Vehicles

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

5, FLUID, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION 4 DR $ s__ NOBID
MERCON V ATF

Bidding On:

Brand: NO BID

Part/Model Number:

Specifications:

For Equipment: Ford Ranger, Ford Van E350,
Ford Van E250, Ford F150 Truck

Date of Delivery:
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ITEM UNIT PRICE
No.  DESCRIPTION QrY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

6. FLUID, TRANSMISSION 2 DR $.183427 ¢ 3668.54 -
TES-295 (OEM ALLISON APPROVED)

Bidding On:

Brand: VALVOLINE

Part/Model Number: #888012

Specifications: COMPLY

For Equipment: Yard Tractors {Transmission)

Year: 2007 & 2010

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

7. FLUID, TRANSMISSION 3 DR $_63570 ¢ 1,907.10 .
DEXRON 11l (H)

Bidding On:
Brand: NAPA
Part/Model Number: _#75-204
Specifications: COMPLY
For Equipment: Tractors (Hydraulics)
Forklifts & Top lifter (Transmission)

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

8. Ol GEAR 2 DR $_662.50 ¢ 1,325.00 -

SAE80W90, API GL-5

Bidding On:

Brand: VALVOLINE

Part/Model Number: _ #692030

Specifications: COMPLY

For Equipment: Top lifters, Forklifts, Tractors,
Gantry Cranes

Date of Delivery: 45 days AR.O.

9. MULTI-PURPOSE, GREASE, 200 TU $__ 977 s 1,954.00 /
HIGH PERFORMANCE, GRADE #2 14.1 oz.
TUBE; Ref: PROLONG SUPER LUBRICANT

Bidding On:

Brand: PROLONG
Part/Model Number: _ #45000
Specifications: COMPLY

For Equipment: Top lifters, Forklifts, Tractors,

Gantry Cranes, & Vehicles

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.C.
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ITEM
No. _ DESCRIPTION

UNIT

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

10. MULTI-PURPOSE, GREASE,
HIGH TEMP, 5 GAL PAIL

Bidding On:

Brand: PROLONG

Part/Model Number: _#45010

Specifications: COMPLY

For Equipment: Top lifters, Forklifts, Tractors,
Gantry Cranes & Vehicles

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

11. COOLANT / ANTIFREEZE
FULLY FORMULATED HEAVY DUTY

PRE-DILUTED; ASTMD6210 or ASTMD6471

Bidding On:

Brand: PRESTONE

Part/Model Number: _#AFC 12100

Specifications: COMPLY

For Equipment: Top lifters, Forklifts, Tractors,
Gantry Cranes & Vehicles

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

12. WD-40 LUBRICANT SPRAY
WITH STRAW, 16 OZ. CAN

Bidding On:
Brand: wD-40
Part/Model Number: #49005
Specifications: 12 0z. can
For Equipment: Top lifters, Forklifts, Tractors,
Gantry Cranes & Vehicles

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

13, COOLANT / ANTIFREEZE,
ASTM D4985 or ASTM D5345

Bidding On:
Brand: PRESTONE

Part/Model Number: #AF3155
Specifications: COMPLY
For Equipment: Gantry Cranes (Cooling System)

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

14. FLUID FILM GREASE, WRO-EP
MiL-PRF-18458C, 5 GAL PAIL

Bidding On:

Brand: NO BID
Part/Model Number:
Specifications:
For Equipment: Gantry Cranes (Wire Ropes)

Date of Delivery:
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ITEM
No. _ DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

UNIT PRICE
PRICE EXTENSION

15, FLUID FiLM, NAS 3 PL
RUST and CORROSION PREVENTIVE
GREASE, 5 GAL PAIL

Bidding On:

Brand: NO BID

Part/Model Number:

Specifications:

For Equipment: Gantry Cranes {Baloney Cables,
Spreader Beams, & Exposed Gears)

Date of Delivery:

16.  MULTI-PURPOSE GREASE WITH AFMT, 5 DR
Ref: PROLONG (120 LBS.)

Bidding On:
Brand: PROLONG
Part/Model Number: #45020
Specifications: COMPLY
For Equipment: Gantry Cranes

{Wire Rope, Wheel Bearings)

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

17. SIMPLE GREEN CONCENTRATED 2 DR
INDUSTRIAL DEGREASER

Bidding On:

Brand: SIMPLE GREEN

Part/Model Number: _ #13008

Specifications: COMPLY

For Equipment: Top lifters, Forklifts, Tractors,
Gantry Cranes & Vehicles

Date of Delivery: 45 days A.R.O.

$ $ NO BID

$1,015.44 ¢ 5,077.20

$_840.99 §1,681.98 S

57/4?3’3, 474.59

TOTAL BID PRICE: $33.634-89
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REQUIRED DELIVERY DATE:
30 days from receipt of purchase order for a period of one (1) year upon the availability of funds. COMPLY

NOTES:
T—:l-l Lubricants must meet or exceed Specifications as shown. COMPLY with NOTES #1 thru #9
2. All Lubricants must be new and unused (virgin stock).
3. Unit of Measure "DR" refers to 55-gailon drum or 120-pound drum.
4. All containers must be factory sealed without leakage and filled accordingly.
5. Bid ltem No.7 above must have OEM Allison TES-295 approval number and approved logo.
6. Bid Item No.6 above, NOTE: Mercon and Dexron are totally different from “MERCON V”.
7. Dexron lll-H and Mercon are not equivalent to “MERCON V”,
8. Bid ltem No.17 above must include one (1) each plastic drum pump and four (4) each quart-size

spray bottles with trigger.
9. All Lubricants to be delivered to PAG must include the Material Safety Data Sheet (MSDS).

DEFINITIONS

AFMT Anti-Friction Metal Treatment

API American Petroleum Institute

ASTM American Society for Testing & Materials for heavy duty diesel engines

CH-4 APi service category for diesel engines introduced in 1998

Dexron i1l (H) OEM General Motors specification for transmission fluid

GL-5 AP service category for gear oil

1SO VG Viscosity grade system for hydraulic oils, introduced by International
Organization for Standardization.

120C John Deere Specification for tractor and hydraulic oil

MERCON V OEM Ford specification for transmission fluid

MIL-PRF Military Performance Specification

NAS National Aeronautical Standard

SAE Society of Automotive Engineers

SM Current API service category for gasoline engines

TES-295 OEM Allison specification for transmission fluid.

WRO-EP Wire Rope Extreme Pressure

THESE SPECIFICATIONS HAVE BEEN DEVELOPED BY THE PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM FLEET AND CRANE
DIVISIONS.
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Trump thriatens
in push to fully
reopen schools

By Laura Meckler
The Washington Post

"The president said today we just
don't want the guidance to be too
tough,” Pence told reporters. “And
that's the reason next week the CDCis
going to be issuing a new set of tools.”

Pence, speaking at a briefing of the
White House coronavirus task force,
was replying to a question about the
CDC's recommendation that students
be kept 6 feet apart to prevent the
spread of the novel coronavirus.

School officials across the coun-
try have concluded they cannot fully
reopen while following that guidance,
because classrooms are too small to
accommodate all students with the

California governor: Reopening
of schools to be based on safety

By Patrick McGreevy the last 24 hours.

Los Angeles Times In recent days, Trump has called on
the country’s public schools to reopen
“quickly and beautifully,” but Los Ange-
les County's top health official said
earlier this week that the surge in new
cases may require continued distance
learning in the county.

On Wednesday, Newsom said he will
not be moved by the president’s criti-
cism on social media of states moving
carefully.

“I'm not worried about the latest
tweets” from the president, Newsom
said during anews conference Wednes-
day. "What we need to address is safely
reopening schools and we need to make
that a foundational principle. That to
me is not negotiable.”

WASHINGTON - President Donald
Trump on Wednesday intensified his
demand that schools fully reopen this
fall, slamming the Centers for Disease
Control and Prevention, pressuring it
to loosen guidance and threatening
to cut funding for schools that do not
open,

The CDC was already planning to
issue new guidelines for schools in
the coming days. But Vice President
Mike Pence on Wednesday explicitly
tied the effort to Trump's ire.

SACRAMENTO, Calif. - Gov. Gavin
Newsom said Wednesday that a deci-
sion on reopening California schools
this fall will be made by local educa-
tion and health officials weighing the
state of the COVID-19 pandemic, and
emphasized that he won't be swayed
by statements from President Donald
Trump urging campuses to bring back
students quickly.

The governor's comments came as
he warned that the number of coro-
navirus hospitalizations in California
is continuing to surge, rising 44% in
the last two weeks, and that another
M Californians died from the virus in
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THIS ADVERTISEMENT WAS PAID WITH GOVERNMENT FUNDS BY:
PORT AUTHORITY OF GUAM
INVITATION FOR BID
BID NO: IFB/PAG-009-20
FOR: Various Lubricants and Degreasers for Port's Equipment
and Grantries
Opening Date:  Tuesday, July 28, 2020 Time: 10:00 a.m.
Place: The Port Authority of Guam

PITI, GUAM - BOARD ROOM

Note: A PDF copy of the bid packet is available to download at www.portofguam.com. PAG
recommends that prospective bidders register current contact Information with PAG fo ensure
they receive any notices regarding any changes or updates to the IFB, The Port Authority of
Guam will not be liable for failure to provide notice to any party who did not register current
contact information,

/S/ RORY J. RESPICIO
General Manager

ROUNDTABLE:
President Donald
Trump, shown above
at Tuesday's round-
table discussion on
the Safe Reopen-
ing of America’s
Schools in the East
Room at the White
House, has taken a
harsh tone in seek-
ing a full reopening
of schools. Jabin
Botsford/The
Washington Post

50 states, more than 1,300 school
districts and thousands of colleges
and universities.

On Wednesday, New York City
schools, the nation's largest school
system, announced a plan that will
have most students in school two
days a week and learning from home
the other three. Many other systems
have announced or are considering
similar plans.

He said his agency’s goal is to work
with districts to help them overcome
challenges and find ways to open

recommended distancing.
Political imperative
The White House is pressing the
case that opening school is neces-

sary for students’ academic and
social-emotional  well-being, and
Trump’s allies see a political impera-
tive in convincing Americans that the
nation has recovered from the corona-
virus crisis.

The administration is finding it
nearly impossible to control the situ-
ation, with the president's views often
at odds with those of his health advis-

ers, and decision-making resting with

Harvard, MIT sue
ICE to halt student
visa guidelines

(Bloomberg News) - Harvard
University and the Massachusetts
Institute of Technology are seeking
a court order to stop the U.S. from
enforcing new visa guidelines that
could cast international students
out of the country if schools offer
only online classes.

"It appears that it was designed
purposefully to place pressure on
colleges and universities to open
their on-campus classrooms for
in-person instruction this fall,
without regard to concerns for
the health and safety of students,
instructors, and others™ amid the
coronavirus pandemic, Harvard
President Lawrence Bacow said
Wednesday in a statement.

The U.S. |mmigration and
Customs Enforcement agency
issued the rules Monday, barring

their doors.

visas for applicants studying
at colieges offering only virtual
instruction. Students on existing
visas whe want to remain in the
U.S. must transfer to a school with
in-person instruction or attend an
institution that offers both remote
and on-campus learning, accord-
ing to ICE.

Harvard is seeking a temporary
restraining order against the new
guidelines. Presiding over the
case is U.S. District Judge Allison
Burroughs in Boston, who ruled
for Harvard in the case alleging
it discriminates against Asian
Americans in admissions. She
scheduled a status conference for
Thursday.

Colleges have begun rolling out
pandemic plans for the fall semes-
ter,withmanyofferingsomeformof
limited in-person classes. Harvard
said about 40% of students would
return toits campus in Cambridge,
Massachusetts, while all courses
will be taught remotely.

735-2244; (671) 735-2243 (TTY).

The University of Guam Solicits Applications To Establish A List Of
Eligibles For The Following Position (Subject to the availability of funds):

#067-20 Associate Network Director

Contact the Human Resources Office at (671) 735-2350 for additional information
regarding requirements, qualifications and application deadline, 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 pm.,
Monday through Friday, except holidays. View the Human Resources Office website at

http:/ /werwuog.edu/hro for detailed information on the job announcement.

The University of Guam is a US. accredited institation and an Equal Opportunity
Employer and Provider and complies with the Americans with Disabilities Act. For
assistance, please contact the Ditector, EEO and Title IX/ADA Coordinator at (671)

/8/ JOSEPH B. GUMATAOTAO
Acting Chief Human Resources Officer

THIS AD IS PAID FOR BY UNIVERSITY OF GUAM FUNDS




